
ITV Ice Makers, Inc. is a dynamic and innovative U.S 
Company, with its factory in Spain. 

After more than 30 years in the business, with over 
half a million customers in nearly 100 countries, we 
strive to surpass our world-renowned reputation of 
keeping these customers happy.  Additionally, our 
commitment is to introduce new energy efficient 
ice makers that meet the ever-changing market and 
demand of new customers.  We seek to accomplish 
this through state-of-the-art production capabilities, 
efficient management systems, and the use of clean 
and environmentally friendly technologies.

As a family-owned business, our values are founded on 
integrity and professional ethics.  We are committed 
to establishing internal policies to reflect positively on 
people’s health and safety, with the flexibility to listen, 
learn and be proactive and responsive to the needs 
of our customers.  With this as our mission, we are 
able to  maintain the passion to achieve excellence 
and success into the future.

About ITV Ice Makers

ITV’s vision is based on continuous and ongoing 
improvement of our processes, establishing goals 
and objectives in order to improve our production 
systems while maintaining maximum efficiencies.

ITV’s main manufacturing facility is vertically 
integrated, automated with robotic machinery, 
reducing labor intensity, and produces a finished 
product that can be described with four basic words:

QUALITY – SIMPLICITY - RELIABILITY – 
SERVICEABILITY

Sincerely,

Cristina and Javier


